Concrete Products Bid # 1404-02

Qry 2 12 12
BIDDER'S NAME ltem A C D
Central Concrete 105.00 105.00 100.00
Phoenix Precast 160.00 160.00 160.00
Shea Concrete Products 112.50 112.50 100.00
Gilbert Block 105.00 105.00 105.00
Extended Cost S 210.00 S 1,260.00 S 1,200.00

Bold Print = Apparent Low Bid
** Awards made to respective vendors of items in bold print
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42.00 42.00 50.00 100.00 no bid
50.00 50.00 124.00 248.00 no bid
58.50 63.00 85.80 126.00 no bid
45.00 45.00 100.00 140.00 1.96

S 2,100.00 S 840.00 S 100.00 S 200.00 S 1,058.40



250 1500 80

K L M
no bid no bid no bid
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1.04 0.59 10.69

S 260.00 S 888.15 S 855.20 $ 8,971.75
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