
Grounds Maintenance  Supplies Bid #1404-03

QTY 300 17 126

BIDDER'S NAME Ally 10-1-10 Nitrozyme MikroPak

Atlantic Golf & Turf no bid no bid no bid
Pro Lawn Supply 25.25 no bid no bid
Northeast Nursery 26.10 212.25 17.50
AAT no bid no bid 93.69

Extended Cost 7,575.00$       3,608.25$       2,205.00$       

Bold Print = Apparent Low Bid 
** Award(s) made on 4/30/14



63 400 103 100 1100

Turf Tech Bio Lime Blend 66L CT Holganix Compost

no bid 5.00 no bid no bid 18.00
no bid 4.55 no bid no bid no bid
124.00 4.67 119.00 26.50 no bid
no bid 4.69 no bid no bid no bid

7,812.00$             1,820.00$         12,257.00$     2,650.00$      19,800.00$      



175 100 320 120 80

Ryegrass Bluegrass MVP Heritage Red Quick Dry

88.50 105.00 no bid no bid no bid
76.25 95.00 11.40 14.40 11.80
89.00 148.00 12.50 16.75 12.90
66.29 72.12 12.88 15.99 13.22

11,600.75$      7,212.00$         3,648.00$         1,728.00$         944.00$            



80 168 280 80 600m

Mound Clay Guide Lime Solu-Cal Agresource Nematodes

no bid no bid 15.00 28.00 no bid
16.85 no bid 13.95 no bid no bid
21.00 6.00 20.00 no bid no bid
18.22 no bid 15.31 no bid no bid

1,348.00$         1,008.00$         3,906.00$         2,240.00$         -$                   



91,362.00$         
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